
May 12, 2022

Gasconade County Commission

MINUTES

The Gasconade County Commission met with Presiding Commissioner Larry Miskel at the 

Courthouse beginning with Pledge of Allegiance.  Attendance: Commissioner Jerry Lairmore, 

Present;  Commissioner Jim Holland, Present;  Presiding Commissioner Larry Miskel, Present.

PRIOR MINUTES

Commissioner Jerry Lairmore made a motion to approve prior commission minutes dated  

5/5/2022 8:30 AM.  Commissioner Jim Holland seconded the motion.  The motion passed by 

vote:  Jerry Lairmore (Yes), Jim Holland (Yes), Larry Miskel (Yes).  

WARRANTS FOR PAYMENT - 118594 through 118595

Commissioner Jerry Lairmore made a motion to approve the following items: 

WARRANTS FOR PAYMENT 118594 through 118595

Commissioner Jim Holland seconded the motion. The motion passed by vote:  Jerry Lairmore 

(Yes), Jim Holland (Yes), Larry Miskel (Yes). 

ROAD CONCERNS AND COMPLAINTS

Commissioner Lairmore said he had several road situations he had looked at with all the rain, 

and the road dept. has been out working on them; Commissioner Holland basically said the 

same thing.  He ask Clerk Lietzow if the county had been reimbursed for road dept's. expenses 

in handling the diesel spill cleanup after an individual ran off the road and hit the brush cutter 

tractor and tank; she said the check from the individual's insurance carrier came in this week for 

$7505.  Commissioner Lairmore said he worked with the road dept. this week in getting an 

invoice prepared to send to Ameren UE to bring Old Woollam road up to county standards after 

their contracting company caused damages that totaled $3850.34.  He is now working on getting 

a new roadway agreement signed by Ameren UE, or their contractor again, this time for the work 

they are doing on Lahmeyer and another road that runs in and out of Gasconade county.

Commission received back from the post office, the certified mail they attempted to send to 

Adam and Natasha Anderson asking them to remove the fence they have put up on easement 

given to the county for Price road; Presiding Commissioner Miskel spoke with the courts to see 

the next option available for delivery.  After the letter is updated with a new completion date 

being June 3, then it will be served by a private process server.

Commission received an invoice from Archer-Elgin Engineering for services performed on the 

BRO project on Valentine Ford road in the amount of $3748.73; Commissioner Lairmore said 

work has started on the project.  Commission was also notified by Harbison Walker that they 

have applied for a new site addition to their permit from MoDNR to mine clay on 8 acres of land 

in Sec. 27, Twp. 42N, Range 5W.

Regarding bids opened at last week's session for liquid asphalt, road dept. recommended 

accepting both companies so that when the product is needed, either of the vendors can be 

contacted for product availability at cheapest price and closest to location needed and 

Commission agreed.

BID DETAIL FOR LIQUID ASPHALT

TYPE   MO Petroleum APAC Central   

MC30 delvrd/applied $6.15 gal

MC800 p/up by county $4.45 gal $3.72 gal

MC3000 delvrd/applied $5.55 gal

CSS 1H Emulsion p/up by co $2.73 gal

CSS 1H Emulsion delv/appld $4.73 gal

MOTION/VOTE - ACCEPT BOTH OF THE BIDS FOR LIQUID ASPHALT AS 

SPECIFIED

Commissioner Jerry Lairmore made a motion to accept both of the bids for liquid asphalt as 

specified. Commissioner Jim Holland seconded the motion. The motion passed by vote:  Jerry 

Lairmore (Yes), Jim Holland (Yes), Larry Miskel (Yes).  

ROAD CONCERNS AND COMPLAINTS

Regarding bids opened at last week's session for hot mix and cold mix, road dept. recommended 

accepting all of them so that when the product is needed, any of the vendors can be contacted 

for product availability at cheapest price and closest to locations needed and Commission 

agreed.

BID DETAIL - COLD MIX/HOT MIX PRICE PER TON

Christensen Bros. Asphalt-EZ Street-$138.00 cold mix/$66.00 hot mix

Capital Materials-MC250-$85.00 cold mix/$65.00 hot mix

NB West Contracting Co.-Bit Base or BP-1-$120.00 cold mix/$61.00 hot mix

May 12, 2022  324



MOTION/VOTE - ACCEPT ALL COLD MIX AND HOT MIX BIDS AS SPECIFIED

Commissioner Jerry Lairmore made a motion to accept all cold mix and hot mix bids as 

specified. Commissioner Jim Holland seconded the motion. The motion passed by vote:  Jerry 

Lairmore (Yes), Jim Holland (Yes), Larry Miskel (Yes).  

ROAD CONCERNS AND COMPLAINTS

Regarding the only bid received for p-gravel at last week's session, road dept. recommended 

accepting and Commission agreed.

BID DETAIL

Hermann Sand and Gravel - $13.00 per ton

MOTION/VOTE - ACCEPT PGRAVEL BID FROM HERMANN SAND AND 

GRAVEL

Commissioner Jerry Lairmore made a motion to accept p-gravel bid from Hermann Sand and 

Gravel. Commissioner Jim Holland seconded the motion. The motion passed by vote:  Jerry 

Lairmore (Yes), Jim Holland (Yes), Larry Miskel (Yes).  

ROAD CONCERNS AND COMPLAINTS

Regarding bids opened for white rock at last week's session, road dept. recommended accepting 

all of them so that when the product is needed, any of the vendors can be contacted for product 

availability at cheapest price and closest to location needed and Commission agreed (priced per 

ton).

BID DETAIL - WHITE ROCK - CAPITAL AT HERMANN     AT LINN     AT OWENSVILLE

3/8" chips clean                         $15.00                                   $15.00        $15.00

1" minus                                     $8.00                                     $8.50           $9.00

1" minus brown                          NO BID                                  NO BID        NO BID

1 1/4" minus                               $8.00                                     $8.50           $9.00

2" minus                                     $9.00                                      $8.50           $9.00

1" clean                                      $11.50                                    $11.00         $12.00

1" road rock                               $10.75                                    $10.25         $11.00

2" clean                                     $10.50                                    $10.50         $10.50

Shot rock                                    $8.00                                      $8.00           $8.00

Rip rap                                        $17.50                                    $17.50         $17.50

                                            BARRETT AT NH        AT BELLE             STEPHAN BROS

3/8" chips clean                         -                                    -                              -

1" minus                                    $7.75                            $7.75                      $7.25

1" minus brown                          -                                    -                              -

1 1/4" minus                              $7.75                            $7.75                      $7.25

2" minus                                    $7.75                             $7.75                      $7.25

1" clean                                     $11.25                          $10.75                    $10.00

1" road rock                              $10.75                          $10.75                     $10.00

2" clean                                     $9.50                            $8.75                      $8.00

Shot rock                                   $5.50                            $5.00                      $6.00

Rip rap                                      $20.00                           $20.00                    $10.00

MOTION/VOTE - ACCEPT ALL WHITE ROCK BIDS AS SPECIFIED

Commissioner Jerry Lairmore made a motion to accept all white rock bids as specified. 

Commissioner Jim Holland seconded the motion. The motion passed by vote:  Jerry Lairmore 

(Yes), Jim Holland (Yes), Larry Miskel (Yes).  

ROAD CONCERNS AND COMPLAINTS

Regarding bids opened for culvert pipe at last week's session, road dept. recommended 

accepting both of them so when the product is needed either of the vendors can be contacted for 

product availability at cheapest price and closest to location needed and Commission agreed.

BID DETAIL - CULVERT PIPE - METAL CULVERTS INC. PRICE PER FOOT

RIV COR GLV 32' HDPE 20' ALUMNZ 32'/40' GALV SPIR CORR 40'

12"diam 16ga $16.00 $9.90 $16.90/$16.50 $15.60

15"diam 16ga $20.15 $12.50 $21.30/20.75 $19.60

18"diam 16ga $23.95 $16.75 $25.25/$24.60 $23.30

21"diam 16ga $27.75 N/A $29.25/$28.50 $26.95

24"diam 14ga $40.30 $28.60 $42.55/$41.45 $39.20

30"diam 14ga $49.50 $47.00 $52.25/$50.90 $48.15

36"diam 14ga $59.00 $62.30 $62.30/$60.70 $57.40

42x29" 14ga $61.90 N/A $65.30/$63.60 $60.20

49x33" 12ga $99.85 N/A $106.00/$103.25 $97.70

57x38" 12ga $114.20 N/A $120.50/$117.40 $111.05

64x43" 12ga $130.15 N/A $137.35/$133.75 $126.55

71x47" 10ga $182.10 N/A $192.15/$187.10 $177.10

12"bands ea $24.00 N/A $25.35/$24.75 $23.40

15"bands ea $30.25 N/A $31.95/$31.15 $29.40

18"bands ea $35.95 N/A $37.90/$36.90 $34.95
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21"bands ea $41.65 N/A $43.90/$42.75 $40.45

24"bands ea $60.45 N/A $63.85/$62.20 $58.80

30"bands ea $74.25 N/A $78.40/$76.35 $72.25

36"bands ea $88.50 N/A $93.45/$91.05 $86.10

VIEBROCK SALES AND SERVICE PRICE PER FOOT

NO BID BLACK POLY20' SPIR ALUMNZ GALV SPIR CORR 40'

12"diam 16ga $8.30 $18.10          $17.50

15"diam 16ga $11.60 $21.65          $21.00

18"diam 16ga $16.25 $27.00             $26.25

21"diam 16ga --- $30.65             $29.80

24"diam 14ga $25.40 $42.95          $42.00

30"diam 14ga $37.80 $54.00             $52.50

36"diam 14ga $48.95 $64.60             $63.00

42x29" 14ga $66.80             $64.90

49x33" 12ga $105.75         $102.70

57x38" 12ga $120.60         $117.20

64x43" 12ga $135.40         $131.60

71x47" 10ga $191.10         $185.60

12"bands ea $8.30 $18.10         $17.50

15"bands ea $11.60 $21.65           $21.00

18"bands ea $16.25    $27.00           $26.25

21"bands ea -- $30.65           $29.80

24"bands ea $25.40 $42.95           $42.00

30"bands ea $37.80   $54.00           $52.50

36"bands ea $48.95 $64.60           $63.00   

MOTION/VOTE - ACCEPT BOTH BIDS FOR CULVERT PIPE AS SPECIFIED

Commissioner Jerry Lairmore made a motion to accept both bids for culvert pipe as specified. 

Commissioner Jim Holland seconded the motion. The motion passed by vote:  Jerry Lairmore 

(Yes), Jim Holland (Yes), Larry Miskel (Yes).  

GENERAL DISCUSSION

US Senator Roy Blunt's office sent Commission information on MO grants virtual workshop from 

USDA Rural Development and how to apply for and manage.

Treasurer Mike Feagan presented the monthly sales and usetax collections received in May; 

sales tax was basically the same as one year ago and usetax was down from previous months; 

he also reported receiving another $500 for maintenance fees for the Richardson cemetery and 

Commissioner Lairmore said it has been mowed.

Commission held the budget amendment hearing to begin the process of amending the 2022 

Gasconade County budget document to include the Gasconade County CDBG fund in the 

amount of $750000.  The Commission has agreed to serve as the governing body qualified to 

apply for, receive and disburse CDBG funds on behalf of the Public Water Supply District #1 

sewer improvements project.  Clerk Lietzow's office and Treasurer Feagan will set up the fund in 

the accounting system for revenue and expense line items as directed by Dept. of Econ. Dev.  

Upon adoption on May 26, the information will be submitted to the State Auditor's office and 

Treasurer Feagan will send the banking information to MRPC who will initiate the first transaction 

of administration fees as a trial run of the process to be sure all is working properly before large 

invoices are needing to be paid.

Presiding Commissioner Miskel had sent a letter to all elected officials and employees within the 

Courthouse asking for comments and suggestions regarding usage of the ARPA funds and to 

have that submitted by today; many made their presentation in person this morning:  Assessor 

Paul Schulte and staff Lisa Diebal, Donna Struttmann and Julia Baker; Collector Shawn 

Schlottach and deputy Glenda Shockley; Sheriff Scott Eiler and office mgr. Felisha Mendenhall; 

Pros. Attorney Mary Weston and staff Kim Birk and Joann Bickmeyer; Judge Ada Brehe-Krueger 

and clerk Jenny Schneider; Clerk Lietzow, Treasurer Feagan and custodian Kristi Fennessey.  

Presiding Commissioner Miskel said that one of the Courthouse projects he considers a safety 

issue is the porch and balcony on the east end of the building and the Commission also has 

preliminary plans to build a building at the Swiss location for Sheriff's Dept., EMD and storage 

area and 2 buildings at the Drake location for the road dept.   Prosecutor Weston started the 

discussion by saying she really hadn't written anything down to submit, and at first she was 

thinking everything she sees in the building that needs attention, ie: electrical maze of wires 

everywhere, broadband functioning throughout, an elevator, and other structural things like 

tuckpointing, floor leveling and support and foundation repairs, that it would take a project 

manager to handle it all.  Then she heard about possibly tearing down 2 of the buildings here on 

the property and fixing one building up for 2 elected officials that don't have offices in the 

Courthouse and should.  She considers the ARPA funds to be taxpayer money that belongs to 

the citizens of Gasconade County and rather than fund non-profits and LLC's, why not spend it 

on the incredible asset that is this building that has a wonderful roof but not much more.  She 

went on to say that she remembers serving on the original Courthouse committee some 10+ 

years ago when the vote was to keep the county seat here; there were plans to build an annex 

on surrounding property that Joe Roetheli bought and gave to Gasconade County to allow for 
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expansion of county government services right on this site, which was needed then and is even 

more necessary now all these years later.  She said building an annex here would solve almost 

every problem we have and allow the elected officials and employees to better serve the public; 

there are so many more people to serve now than when this Courthouse was built, but we are all 

still operating from within this one building.  Now we have the money to move forward with 

expansion and we need to use it to benefit the taxpayers.  

Judge Brehe Krueger came in near the end of Prosecutor Weston's comments so she didn't 

know what had already been said, but first she wanted to say thank you to the Commission for 

including all of us in this discussion; she also agrees, the first item on her list is the annex, as she 

too remembers the plans were drawn for that.  She understands that oral commitments have 

already been made by the Commission for awarding some of this money to other agencies, so 

she does feel like asking all of us was an afterthought by them.  She understands there may 

need to be new buildings at Swiss and Drake, but she doesn't feel like Commission gave any 

real thought to what we need right here.  She let them know that was very hard to hear, because 

all of us work hard in this building everyday and she is sure by now the Commission can sense 

the frustration in the room from everyone present.  She wonders if any of our comments today in 

person or submitted in writing will be taken seriously.  Regarding the issue of space,  Clerk 

Schneider said there is a several-day jury trial coming up in June, on the same days as regular 

court in 1 or 2 more locations of which there is not enough courtroom space, but everyone here 

will make do with the situation we have, but are not providing the services as they should be and 

as the participants deserve; she also said if an annex is built, that would be the time for the 

Circuit Clerk and Recorder's office to be split.  

Others mentioned much like Prosecutor Weston did, about all the many fixes needed here, some 

of which are in the Circuit Clerk's office and no one is here to speak of those and Presiding 

Commissioner Miskel said we can't fix these things if we don't know about it; while that is true, 

several of the public areas are very obviously in need of repairs that aren't being done and 

Donna Struttmann, Assessor's office said she would much rather see that money being spent 

here than giving it away to others.  Presiding Commissioner Miskel reminded everyone that they 

are welcome to come into these meetings anytime to talk about anything, but everyone feels like 

there is no time as they are busy in their own offices. He also reminded them they can also read 

the minutes to keep up with what is going on.  He is used to seeing more people in their 

meetings in Owensville than anytime here; Clerk Schneider said she would have plenty to talk 

about every week, but considers it would sound like nagging.  Commissioner Holland said he 

would look at any of these issues they have, but he has to know about them first.   The same can 

be said by most everyone present too, that they do not feel like they even know what the 

Commission is doing or handling and so they are unaware. 

Presiding Commissioner Miskel assured everyone that this building was not an afterthought for 

use of these funds, but the county does own properties in these 2 other locations that also need 

attention.  He has personally requested that $350000 be set aside mostly for this property, 

besides the safety issue mentioned earlier, also tearing down 2 of the old buildings and 

preparing that area for construction, remodeling the red brick house to the west into office space 

for elected official use since nearly 40 years remain on the 50-year covenant.  Commissioner 

Holland said he does not feel like the Commission is ignoring everyone here, but they just didn't 

know how everyone felt, which was not received well by those in the room.  Commissioner 

Lairmore said he doesn't disagree with building an annex, but he's not sure there is enough 

money left to do that; it also still leaves the issue of fixing everything in this building that is 

obviously needed and remembers, after the vote many years ago to keep the county seat here, 

the promise of private funds to renovate the Courthouse so this would be the only Courthouse in 

existence built entirely with private funds and then renovated with private funds.  Unfortunately, 

when the county did not have enough money to build the annex at the time, the private funds did 

not materialize either and no one knows if they still exist.  Clerk Lietzow said the engineers' 

annex drawing was paid for by a private individual who also had served on committees' at that 

time and wanted to see it move forward; the now defunct, Gasc. Co. Courthouse Society, was 

active at that time in participating with the limited funding they had.  Commissioner Lairmore also 

went on to state his firm opinion that not a dime be spent on the red brick building for office 

space and has always preferred it be moved to a better suited location; the question was ask if 

that was acceptable and Presiding Commissioner Miskel said the covenant does not address 

that specifically, but we could get a legal opinion.

Collector Shawn Schlottach acknowledged that Commission is responsible for all buildings and 

grounds, but wished the Courthouse would have been the priority building since this is the first 

time funds have been available, and withes Commission would have spent the funds here fixing 

everything wrong. Since a significant portion of the funds have been allocated elsewhere, 

Deputy Shockley ask if that oral commitment to the outside agencies was final or could that 

action be rescinded and all of the funds be kept for county use and Commissions' answer was it 

was too late to change that action.  Joann Bickmeyer, PA's office, ask what other counties are 

doing; Clerk Lietzow said the other counties that are in the Meramec Region are using it for their 

own buildings or needs as was Warren County.

Treasurer Feagan commented that he would like to see the ARPA funds be used for a certain 

amount of time to pay for a security officer at the front door everyday the Courthouse is open; 
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after the event last week involving an irate taxpayer, the seriousness of that potential problem 

was obvious.  He would hope that at some point, the new Law Enforcement Sales Tax Fund 

could pick up the salary for the officer.  Assessor Schulte agreed that was a very important need 

as situations can go bad very quickly.

Clerk Lietzow apologized to all for not saying something to everyone present from the moment 

these funds came in, because she told the Commission she thought that would be the only 

opportunity they would ever have to build an annex; Buck Collier, Gasconade County 

Republican, said in fairness, the money wasn't allowed to be spent that way in the beginning.  

The biggest issue her office has is lack of space, not only for working on elections, but just in 

waiting on customers on a daily basis.  Her list also includes an elevator as mentioned earlier, 

since the waiver given to the county by US Dept. of Justice was granted due to lack of funds, 

which really isn't applicable now.  She would also like to see the entire parking lot paved and 

striped for parking included the steep hill and bottom base of the hill.  In listening to all the 

comments made today, she also thinks that she should offer a copy of the minutes to all the 

offices each week.

Last question ask by Deputy Baker was what is the timeline, since the Commission knows 

everyones' thoughts and comments, Presiding Commissioner Miskel said they will review all the 

written requests and they have to allocate the usage by 2024 and have to have it spent by 2026.  

Everyone said thanks for listening and keep the money in the taxpayer's building.

REPORT OF FEES
Commission reviews report of fees for    April 2022     , from Pamela R. Greunke, Circuit Clerk and Recorder 

of Deeds for Divisions 1, 2 and 4 in the following amounts:

Recording-$7666.31          Dom Viol-$35.00             CERF-$2576.00         Rec Records Reten-$2332.00                     

Record Techn-$451.25     Clerk fees-$794.32      County fees-$414.68        Incarc/medcl costs-$2325.65                    

LETF-$78.00         PATF-$101.54       Fines-$7300.00           Sheriff's fees/mileage-$456.20 

Overpayment-$8.00         Misc county fees-$28.50        Dep. Sher. Sal. Suppl.-$30.00                   

Inmate Security Fund-$182.00        Family Court-$345.00

ABATEMENTS AND ADDITIONS

Commission received for file abatements #2253 and additions #9234 through #9248.

ADJOURN

Commissioner Jim Holland made a motion to adjourn commission until  5/19/2022.  

Commissioner Jerry Lairmore seconded the motion.  The meeting was adjourned. 

SIGNATURES

____________________  _____________________  ___________________

May 12, 2022  328


